
Paralan rolls out HVD SCSI Hard Drives 
 

SCSI High Voltage Differential Drive Users can now get HVD SCSI hard drive storage 
with SATA inside 

 
Legacy HVD SCSI based systems can upgrade to SATA without having to replace their 

entire system infrastructure 
 
December 14, 2010 - San Diego, CA 
 
Paralan, (http//:www.paralan.com) the world's SCSI experts, today announced the 
availability of two new 3.5 inch HVD SCSI hard drives.  Both the 250 gigabyte SHD-250 
and the 500 gigabyte SHD-500 can be factory configured to look like smaller capacity 
HVD SCSI drives for those systems that have a smaller maximum drive capacity.   
 
The new drives allow military, manufacturing and industrial applications to easily replace 
their old and failing HVD hard drives with faster, larger and more modern SATA based 
HVD SCSI drives. The SHD 250 and SHD 500 are basically 2.5 inch SATA drives 
converted to have the same physical form and connections and communicate as 3.5 inch 
68 pin wide HVD SCSI drives.  
 
"Don't replace the entire system, just update the storage," says Marc Brooks, CEO of 
Paralan. "Many of our industrial customers have been telling us they cannot find 
replacements for their HVD SCSI drives and have been using expensive workarounds or 
purchasing entire new systems. Now they can simply unplug the old dying or dead HVD 
SCSI drive and connect a new Paralan SHD series drive." 
 
Until now, no one has manufactured HVD SCSI Hard Drives for about five years. There 
are tens of thousands of military and industrial systems in the world that still use HVD 
SCSI as their storage solution.  To fill this need, Paralan has developed the new SHD 
series HVD SCSI drives. 
 
For those systems with limited storage bandwidth, Paralan can supply any of the SHD 
Series HVD SCSI drives in a range of storage capacities to allow industrial engineers to 
match the storage capacity of the new drives to the storage capacity of the existing 
system. 
 
Prices for the SHD-250 and the SHD-500 start off at $495 and $595 in single unit 
quantities respectively.  Quantity discounts are available. 
 
More about Paralan 
 
Before the development of SCSI Bus Expanders, SCSI cable length was restricted to 
short distances. To address this limitation, Paralan Corporation invented and 
manufactured the world's first fiber optic SCSI Bus Extender compatible with any 
manufacturer's SCSI host adapters and SCSI peripherals. 



 
As pioneers in developing and manufacturing this technology, Paralan is the most trusted 
name in SCSI Bus Enhancement. The company's high-quality, reliable product lines 
include iSCSI Bridges, SCSI Extenders, SCSI Converters, SCSI Enhanced Drives and 
Narrow SCSI Replacement Drives, SCSI Switches, premium SCSI Quiet Cables™, SCSI 
Cable Testers, and Ultra320 Host Bus Adapters.  

Founded in 1988, San Diego-based Paralan designs and manufactures both off-the-shelf 
and custom products for industry leaders like IBM, Siemens, Alcatel, Xerox, and 
Northrop Grumman. Paralan's products are embedded in computer installations 
worldwide, making SCSI work.  
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